
Family group conferences 

Family decision making sits com­
fortably with the philosophy of the 
Victorian child welfare legislation, 
and also with the United Nations 
Convention on the Rights of the 
Child, to which Australia is a signa­
tory. The Convention, in Articles 5 
and 7, acknowledges that children 
should primarily be in parental care 
unless best interest considerations 
dictate otherwise (Brewer & Swain 
1993:3). 

It makes good sense to ask families 
to take responsibi l i ty for deciding 
how bes t to care for their chi ldren, 
and for implement ing those dec i s ­
ions. Family decision making has the 
potential to transform case planning 
as it is usually experienced by fam­
ilies, so that it becomes participatory 
In reality. If the New Zealand exper­
ience is our guide, the approach 
could significantly alter the shape of 
our child welfare system. Time, and 
the willingness of the statutory child 
welfare system to relinquish control 
over families' lives, will tell if this 
potential can be realized. • 
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